City of Lewisville
Annual Contract for Police Uniforms

Bid #08-32-A
Stroud Safety Apparel Tyler Uniform, Inc. Tyler Uniform, Inc. Uniforms, Inc.
Stroud, OK Tyler, TX Tyler, TX Dallas, TX
*Alternate
Item|Description Qty] U/M] Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 |Men's Trousers 80| ea No Bid No Bid $33.00 $2,640.00 $37.75 $3,020.00
Horace Small Horace Small
2 |Women's Trousers 20| ea No Bid No Bid $33.00 $660.00 $37.75 $755.00
Horace Small Horace Small
3 |New Generation 2 - Jacket 30| ea No Bid No Bid $99.00 $2,970.00 $127.50 $3,825.00
Horace Small Horace Small
4 |Men's Short Sleeve Shirt 80| ea No Bid No Bid $30.00 $2,400.00 $33.00 $2,640.00 $37.95 $3,036.00
Horace Small | *Button Down | Horace Small Horace Small
5 |Men's Long Sleeve Shirt 80| ea No Bid No Bid $32.00 $2,560.00 $35.00 $2,800.00 $41.05 $3,284.00
Horace Small | *Button Down | Horace Small Horace Small
6 [Women's Long Sleeve Shirt | 20 | ea No Bid No Bid $32.00 $640.00 $35.00 $700.00 $41.05 $821.00
Horace Small | *Button Down | Horace Small Horace Small
7 [Women's Short Sleeve Shirt | 20 | ea No Bid No Bid $30.00 $600.00 $33.00 $660.00 $37.95 $759.00
Horace Small | *Button Down | Horace Small Horace Small
8 |Reversible Raincoat 15] ea No Bid No Bid $54.00 $810.00 $74.50 $1,117.50
Neese Neese
9 |Rain Suit 15| ea No Bid No Bid $85.00 $1,275.00 $79.95 $1,199.25
Neese Neese
10 |Uniform Cap with Cover 20| ea No Bid No Bid $32.00 $640.00 $44.45 $889.00
Bayly Midway
11 |Vision Quest Vest 15] ea $16.75 $251.25 $60.00 $900.00 $54.20 $813.00
Iron Horse PPV42 Fechheimer 71500 Gerber
Grand Total: $251.25 $6,200.00 $16,695.00 $19,518.75
*incomplete *incomplete
Standard Delivery: 10 Days 5-10 Days 5-10 Days 7-10 Working
(Rainwear 20- (Rainwear 20- Days
30 Days) 30 Days)
7-10 Working
Standard Delivery for Re-Order: Not Available 5-10 Days 5-10 Days Days
On-Site Measurements: Not Available 36 Hours 36 Hours 5 Hours
Office Location: Stroud, Ok Tyler, TX Tyler, TX Dallas, TX

*Tyler Uniform, Inc. provided an Alternate bid for item number’s: 4 through 7 for Horace Small button down shirts.

*THE NAMES AND AMOUNTS SHOWN HEREON ARE FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY AN DO NOT GUARANTEE THAT THE

LOW BIDDER OR ANY OTHER BIDDER WILL BE AWARDED A CONTRACT FOR GOODS OR SERVICES. THIS SHEET SERVES AS A

LISTING, NOT A RANKING, OF BIDS RECEIVED. THESE BIDS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER REVIEW. THE CITY WILL MAKE A
DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF EACH BID UPON APPLICABLE LAWS, POLICIES, AND SPECIFICATIONS.




