City of Lewisville
Bid #08-28-
Swim Suits for Lewisville Wave Swim Team

Female Suits:

Speedo Radiance Superpro

Male Suits:
Speedo Quantum Splice
D & J Sports Keifer Swim Shop The Finals
Item Description Qty U/M Unit Price  Total Unit Price  Total Unit Price  Total
1.1 Female, Size 20 10 Each $43.00  $430.00 $47.35 $473.50 no bid no bid
1.2 Female, Size 22 17 Each $43.00  $731.00 $47.35  $804.95 no bid no bid
1.3 Female, Size 24 13 Each $43.00 $559.00 $47.35 $615.55 no bid no bid
1.4 Female, Size 26 14 Each $43.00  $602.00 $48.75  $682.50 no bid no bid
1.5 Female, Size 28 12 Each $43.00 $516.00 $48.75 $585.00 no bid no bid
1.6 Female, Size 30 8 Each $43.00  $344.00 $48.75  $390.00 no bid no bid
1.7 Female, Size 32 5 Each $43.00 $215.00 $48.75 $243.75 no bid no bid
1.8 Female, Size 34 4 Each $43.00 $172.00 $48.75  $195.00 no bid no bid
1.9 Female, Size 36 4 Each $43.00 $172.00 $48.75 $195.00 no bid no bid
1.10 Female, Size 38 1 Each $43.00 $43.00 $48.75 $48.75 no bid no bid
1.11 Female, Size 40 1 Each $43.00 $43.00 $48.75 $48.75 no bid no bid
2.1 Male, Size 22 4 Each $24.00 $96.00 $26.35 $105.40 A] $25.95 $103.80 B
2.2 Male, Size 24 7 Each $24.00 $168.00 $26.35 $184.45 A] $25.95 $181.65 B
2.3 Male, Size 26 9 Each $24.00 $216.00 $26.35 $237.15 A] $25.95 $233.55 B
2.4 Male, Size 28 9 Each $24.00 $216.00 $26.35 $237.15 A] $25.95 $233.55 B
2.5 Male, Size 30 6 Each $24.00 $144.00 $27.60 $165.60 A] $25.95 $155.70 B
2.6 Male, Size 32 6 Each $24.00 $144.00 $27.60 $165.60 A] $25.95 $155.70 B
2.7 Male, Size 34 5 Each $24.00 $120.00 $27.60 $138.00 A] $25.95 $129.75 B
2.8 Male, Size 36 2 Each $24.00 $48.00 $27.60 $55.20 A| $25.95 $51.90 B
2.9 Male, Size 38 1 Each $24.00 $24.00 $27.60 $27.60 A] $25.95 $25.95 B
Total: $5,003.00 $5,598.90 $1,271.55
Female Suits:
Nike Break Thru Fastnack Tank
Male Suits:
Finals Reactor Splice Keifer Swim Shop D & J Sports The Finals
Item Description Qty U/M Unit Price  Total Unit Price  Total Unit Price  Total
3.1 Female, Size 20 10 Each no bid no bid $43.00 $430.00 no bid nobid C
3.2 Female, Size 22 17 Each no bid no bid $43.00  $731.00 $25.95 $441.15 C
3.3 Female, Size 24 13 Each $48.75 $633.75 $43.00 $559.00 $25.95 $337.35 C
3.4 Female, Size 26 14 Each $48.75 $682.50 $43.00 $602.00 $25.95 $363.30 C
3.5 Female, Size 28 12 Each $48.75 $585.00 $43.00 $516.00 $25.95 $311.40 C
3.6 Female, Size 30 8 Each $48.75 $390.00 $43.00 $344.00 $25.95 $207.60 C
3.7 Female, Size 32 5 Each $48.75 $243.75 $43.00 $215.00 $25.95 $129.75 C
3.8 Female, Size 34 4 Each $48.75 $195.00 $43.00 $172.00 $25.95 $103.80 C
3.9 Female, Size 36 4 Each $48.75 $195.00 $43.00 $172.00 $25.95 $103.80 C
3.10 Female, Size 38 1 Each $48.75 $48.75 $43.00 $43.00 $25.95 $2595 C
3.11 Female, Size 40 1 Each no bid no bid $43.00 $43.00 $25.95 $2595 C
4.1 Male, Size 22 4 Each $26.35  $105.40 no bid no bid $22.95 $91.80
4.2 Male, Size 24 7 Each $26.35 $184.45 no bid no bid $22.95  $160.65
4.3 Male, Size 26 9 Each $26.35 $237.15 no bid no bid $22.95 $206.55
4.4 Male, Size 28 9 Each $26.35 $237.15 no bid no bid $22.95  $206.55
4.5 Male, Size 30 6 Each $27.60 $165.60 no bid no bid $22.95 $137.70
4.6 Male, Size 32 6 Each $27.60 $165.60 no bid no bid $22.95  $137.70
4.7 Male, Size 34 5 Each $27.60 $138.00 no bid no bid $22.95 $114.75
4.8 Male, Size 36 2 Each $27.60 $55.20 no bid no bid $22.95 $45.90
4.9 Male, Size 38 1 Each $27.60 $27.60 no bid no bid $22.95 $22.95
Total: $4,289.90 $3,827.00 $3,174.60

**THE NAMES AND AMOUNTS SHOWN HEREON ARE FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY AND DO NOT
GUARANTEE THAT THE LOW BIDDER OR ANY OTHER BIDDER WILL BE AWARDED A CONTRACT FOR GOODS OR
SERVICES. THIS SHEET SERVES AS A LISTING, NOT A RANKING, OR BIDS RECEIVED. THESE BIDS ARE
CURRENTLY UNDER REVIEW. THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF EACH

BID UPON APPLICABLE LAWS, POLICIES, AND SPECIFICATIONS.

A-THE QUANTUM SPLICE JAMMER WAS SUBSTITUTED FOR THE REQUESTED SPEEDO QUANTUM SPLICE.
B-THE FINALS REACTOR SPLICE WAS SUBSTITUTED FOR THE REQUESTED SPEEDO QUANTUM SPLICE.

C-THE FINALS GLIDE SPLICE WAS SUBSTITUTED FOR THE NIKE BREAK THRU FASTBACK.




