Water & Wastewater Chemicals

Bid #08-15-A DPC Industries Altivia Chemical Lime, Co. US Lime Company St. Clair
Cleburne, TX Houston, TX Hurst, TX Marble City, OK
Item |Description Quantity UM Unit Price Total Delivery Unit Price Total Delivery JUnit Price Total Delivery Unit Price Total Delivery
1 [Liquid Chlorine 210 Ton $544.00 $114,240.00 3-4 days $650.00 $136,500.00 2-3 days no bid no bid
2 |Bulk Hydrated Lime 200 Ton no bid no bid $115.00 $23,000.00 48 hrs. $160.00 $32,000.00 none listed
3 |Hydrated Lime, 50 Ib. bag 1000 Ib. no bid no bid no bid no bid
4 [Hydrofluorosilicic Acid 25 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
5 JActivated Carbon 2 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
6 [Magnifloc Polymer 4400 Gallon no bid $9.00 $39,600.00 2-3 days no bid no bid
Aqualum 3002
7 |Cationic Polymer, 80 Ib. bag 14 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
8 [Cationic Polymer, 55 Gal. drum 2530 Gallon no bid no bid no bid no bid
9 JAnhydrous Ammonia 28 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
10 |Liquid Ferric Sulfate 610 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
11 ]Calcium Hypochlorite 100 100 Ib. bucket $148.50 $14,850.00 monthly no bid no bid no bid
route
12 JLiquid Sulfur Dioxide 80 Ton $562.00 $44,960.00 3-4 days no bid no bid no bid
Pencco, Inc. Solvay Fluorides, LLC Univar Ashland, Inc.
San Felipe, TX Houston, TX Dallas, TX Greensboro, NC
Item |Description Quantity UM Unit Price Total Delivery Unit Price Total Delivery JUnit Price Total Delivery Unit Price Total Delivery
1 |Liquid Chlorine 210 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
2 |Bulk Hydrated Lime 200 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
3 |Hydrated Lime, 50 Ib. bag 1000 Ib. no bid no bid no bid no bid
4 JHydrofluorosilicic Acid 25 Ton $610.50 $15,262.50 none listed $695.00 $17,375.00 5 days no bid no bid
min 40,000 Ib del.
5 JActivated Carbon 2 Ton no bid no bid $1,500.00 $3,000.00 none listed no bid
6 |Magnifloc Polymer 4400 Gallon no bid no bid no bid $4.23 $18,612.00 7-10 days
Praestol 187 KH
7 |Cationic Polymer, 80 Ib. bag 14 Ton no bid no bid no bid $2,960.00 $41,440.00 7-10 days
Praestol 855 BS
8 |Cationic Polymer, 55 Gal. drum 2530 Gallon no bid no bid no bid $8.34 $21,100.20 4-6 days
Praestol K280 BCG
9 JAnhydrous Ammonia 28 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
10 [Liquid Ferric Sulfate 610 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
11 |Calcium Hypochlorite 100 100 Ib. bucket no bid no bid $169.50 $16,950.00 none listed no bid
12 |Liquid Sulfur Dioxide 80 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid




Polydyne Chemrite Atlantic Coast Polymers, Inc. Airgas
Riceboro, GA Buford, GA Austin, TX Duluth, GA
Item ]Description Quantity UM Unit Price Total Delivery Unit Price Total Delivery Unit Price |Total Delivery Unit Price Total Delivery
1 [Liquid Chlorine 210 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
2 |Bulk Hydrated Lime 200 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
3 |Hydrated Lime, 50 Ib. bag 1000 Ib. no bid no bid no bid no bid
4 Hydrofluorosilicic Acid 25 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
5 JActivated Carbon 2 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
6 |Magnifloc Polymer 4400 Gallon $5.43 $23,900.80 7-10 days * no bid no bid
Clarifloc C-138
7 |Cationic Polymer, 80 Ib. bag 14 Ton $3,050.00 | $42,700.00 7-10 days $4,840.00 $67,760.00 4-6 days $3,750.00 $52,500.00 5 bus. days no bid
Clarifloc CE-787 Kemira C-496 ACP-315
8 |Cationic Polymer, 55 Gal. drum 2530 Gallon $8.42 | $21,289.95 7-10 days * $10.55 $26,691.50 5 bus. days no bid
Clarifloc C-6266 ACP-505
9 JAnhydrous Ammonia 28 Ton no bid no bid no bid $740.00 $20,720.00 none listed
10 |Liquid Ferric Sulfate 610 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
11 ]Calcium Hypochlorite 100 100 Ib. bucket no bid $134.00 $13,400.00 3-6 days no bid no bid
1 pallet min.
12 [Liquid Sulfur Dioxide 80 Ton no bid no bid no bid no bid
General Chemical
Parsippany, NJ
Item ]Description Quantity UM Unit Price Total Delivery
1 |Liquid Chlorine 210 Ton no bid
2 |Bulk Hydrated Lime 200 Ton no bid
3 |Hydrated Lime, 50 Ib. bag 1000 Ib. no bid
4 [Hydrofluorosilicic Acid 25 Ton no bid
5 JActivated Carbon 2 Ton no bid
6 [Magnifloc Polymer 4400 Gallon no bid
7 |Cationic Polymer, 80 Ib. bag 14 Ton no bid
8 |Cationic Polymer, 55 Gal. drum 2530 Gallon no bid
9 JAnhydrous Ammonia 28 Ton no bid
10 |Liquid Ferric Sulfate 610 Ton $165.00 $100,650.00 none listed
11 |Calcium Hypochlorite 100 100 Ib. bucket no bid
12 |Liquid Sulfur Dioxide 80 Ton no bid

*Chemrite provided pricing for items 6 & 8, however, due to a pricing error the items were withdrawn. In addition, Chemrite did not submit samples for items 6, 7 & 8.

*THE NAMES AND AMOUNTS SHOWN HEREON ARE FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY AN DO NOT GUARANTEE THAT THE

LOW BIDDER OR ANY OTHER BIDDER WILL BE AWARDED A CONTRACT FOR GOODS OR SERVICES. THIS SHEET SERVES AS A

LISTING, NOT A RANKING, OF BIDS RECEIVED. THESE BIDS ARE CURRENTLY UNDER REVIEW. THE CITY WILL MAKE A

DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF EACH BID UPON APPLICABLE LAWS, POLICIES, AND SPECIFICATIONS.




